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... and an actress who made
her film debut in the Tamil film

Oru Kadhal Seivir and soon
became known for her

controversial role in the
Kannada film Ganda Hendati. .

Her debut in Tamil cinema,
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Bhadravari, was at the Cannes
Film Festival in 2005. The

same year, she starred in the
Kannada film Kashmiri, which
became a hit at the Tamil box
office and won an award at the

Cannes Film Festival. The
actress starred in the 2007
Tamil epic film Nadir. The

famous Tamil actress
Karunanidhi Thakka starred in

the film. Her Kannada film
Kashmiri Sangham won an
award at the Kannada Film

Festival.
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Ganda Hendati: Directed by
Ravishrivastsa. With Ravi
Belagere, Manju Bhashini,
Sanjanaa Galrani, Vishal

Hegde. A housewife
dissatisfied with her marriage
... I don't want to live with this
husband anymore. A husband

who earns three thousand
rupees a year, what good can
he do? Ravi Belgi: I'm trying to
find some business for myself,

but I can't find what I really
like. I can't work with someone
I don't like. This year I'm trying
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to find what I really like. Ravi
Belgi: I have to find something
for myself that I really like, but
I don't know what I like. I don't
know what I like. dd2bc28256
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